DTI-04-0087, Technical Staffing and Services
New Contract Vendors
PRICING MATRIX
[Effective July 1, 2004]
(14 pages total)

Abator Alliance Applied Systems

Information Ajilon Consulting American Information | Apex Analysis & Processing,

Services Inc. Consulting Group Inc. Technology Solutions Systems Inc. Inc.
Mainframe
Programmer/Analysts 50- 75 55-60 55- 75 55.41 to 63.72 50-60 45-84
Senior Programmer/Analysts 55- 90 60-70 75- 90 80.60 to 92.69 60-70 55-95
E-commerce Programmer 75- 110 64-70 80- 90 66.49 to 76.47 60-70 70-116
Senior E-commerce Programmer 85- 125 70-80 80 - 100 86.64 to 99.64 70-80 85-121
System Analysts 60 - 65 56-62 55- 75 65.49 to 75.31 45-55 60-95
Senior System Analysts 50 - 80 62-70 65- 80 80.60 to 92.69 60-70 70-105
Project Leaders 60- 115 68-74 65- 75 110.82 to 127.45 65-75 70-100
Project Facilitators 65- 95 60-65 65- 75 65.49 to 75.31 70-80 75-100
IT Project Managers 100 - 175 74-80 80 - 100 85.64 to 87.51 75-85 80-116
Data Specialist 55- 90 64-70 75- 85 68.51 t0 78.78 60-70 70-116
Software Specialist 90 - 120 62-68 60- 75 56.42 to 64.88 60-70 65-110
Sr. Software Specialist 100 - 165 68-76 75- 85 86.64 to 99.64 70-80 75-126
Database Specialists 85- 125 66-76 70 - 80 69.82 to 80.30 70-90 65-100
Business Recovery Analysts 65-74 80- 100 75.20 to 86.69 70-80 75-100
Capacity Mgmt. Specialist 100 - 150 52-63 80 - 100 80.60 to 92.69 40-60 56-94
Service Support Specialist 35-45 25- 35 79.80 t0 91.77 30-50 45-79
Service Support Administrator 45-55 35- 45 69.32 to 80.30 40-60 65-95
System Control Specialist 45-50 55- 70 79.80 to 91.77 40-60 45-75
Computer Operator 28-32 20- 30 52.37 t0 60.25 20-30 25-40
Sr. Computer Operator 32-37 40 - 55 62.46 to 71.83 30-40 27-45
Lead Computer Operator 37-44 55- 70 68.511t0 78.78 40-50 30.75-51
Output Mgmt. Specialist 40-48 20- 30 79.80 t0 91.77 30-50 25-40
Lead Output Mgmt. Specialist 48-58 55- 70 80.60 to 92.69 40-60 43-71
Production Scheduler 45-50 50 - 60 80.60 to 92.69 30-40 43-71
Storage Mgmt. Specialist 65-70 75- 95 69.82 to 80.30 50-70 31-51
System Administrator 75- 115 58-62 65- 80 60.45 to 69.52 50-70 45-70
Technical Writer 45- 75 48-54 45- 55 39.90 to 45.89 50-70 38-58
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DTI-04-0087, Technical Staffing and Services

New Contract Vendors
PRICING MATRIX
[Effective July 1, 2004]
(14 pages total)

Abator Alliance Applied Systems

Information Ajilon Consulting American Information | Apex Analysis & Processing,

Services Inc. Consulting Group Inc. Technology Solutions Systems Inc. Inc.
Client Server
Programmer/Analysts 50- 75 56-62 65 - 80 55.41 10 63.72 50-60 55-95
Senior Programmer/Analysts 55- 90 62-72 80- 90 80.60 to 92.69 60-70 65-105
E-commerce Programmer 60 - 100 66-72 80- 90 66.49 to 76.47 60-70 70-116
Senior E-commerce Programmer 80- 120 72-80 80 - 100 86.64 to 99.64 70-80 80-116
System Analysts 60 - 65 58-64 65- 75 65.49 to 75.31 45-55 60-95
Senior System Analysts 50 - 80 64-74 80- 90 80.60 to 92.69 60-70 70-105
Project Leaders 60- 115 68-76 65- 75 110.82 to 127.45 65-75 75-100
Project Facilitators 65- 95 60-66 65- 75 65.49 to 75.31 70-80 75-100
IT Project Managers 100 - 175 76-82 80 - 100 85.64 to 87.51 75-85 85-131
Data Specialist 55- 90 64-70 75- 85 68.511t0 78.78 60-70 70-116
Software Specialist 90 - 120 68-74 60 - 75 56.42 to 64.88 60-70 70-100
Sr. Software Specialist 100 - 165 74-82 75- 90 86.64 to 99.64 70-80 80-126
Database Specialists 85- 125 62-74 70 - 80 69.82 to 80.30 70-90 70-116
Business Recovery Analysts 64-74 80 - 100 75.20 to 86.69 70-80 75-110
Capacity Mgmt. Specialist 100 - 150 55-64 80 - 100 80.60 to 92.69 40-60 63-105
Service Support Specialist 35-45 25- 35 79.80 t0 91.77 30-50 45-79
Service Support Administrator 45-55 35- 45 69.32 to 80.30 40-60 65-95
System Control Specialist 45-50 55- 70 79.80 to 91.77 40-60 50-85
Computer Operator 28-32 20 - 30 52.37 t0 60.25 20-30 25-40
Sr. Computer Operator 32-37 440 - 55 62.46 to 71.83 30-40 28-45
Lead Computer Operator 37-44 55- 70 68.511t0 78.78 40-50 35-55
Output Mgmt. Specialist 40-48 20- 30 79.80 t0 91.77 30-50 25-40
Lead Output Mgmt. Specialist 48-58 55- 70 80.60 to 92.69 40-60 45-75
Production Scheduler 50-55 50 - 60 80.60 to 92.69 30-40 45-75
Storage Mgmt. Specialist 65-70 75- 100 69.82 to 80.30 50-70 35-55
System Administrator 75- 115 64-74 70- 85 60.45 to 69.52 50-70 50-76
Technical Writer 45- 75 56-62 45 - 55 39.90 to 45.89 50-70 42-64
Platform Independent Services
Business Analysts 50- 85 54-70 55- 70 75.26 to 86.89 55-65 80-131
E-commerce Analysts 65- 100 52-68 55- 70 60.60 to 92.69 65-75 70-131
E-commerce Software Specialist 95- 155 70-80 70 - 90 60.45 to 69.52 75-85 80-116
Disaster Recovery Coordinator 85- 145 80- 100 80.60 to 92.69 60-80
IT Architects 100 - 185 75-90 80— 110 141.05 to 162.20 90-120 90-131
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DTI-04-0087, Technical Staffing and Services
New Contract Vendors
PRICING MATRIX
[Effective July 1, 2004]
(14 pages total)

Applied Brandywine

Technologies, Technology Cannon Technology Computer Aid, Covansys

Inc. Partners Solutions, Inc. CIBER, Inc. Inc. Corporation
Mainframe
Programmer/Analysts 40 - 80 41.48 - 68.76 66 - 72 60 - 80 50-70 60-70
Senior Programmer/Analysts 45 -85 47.19 - 73.61 72-79 68 - 90 65-85 70-80
E-commerce Programmer 75-110 42.07 - 69.84 66 - 72 69 - 90 50-125 70-80
Senior E-commerce Programmer 85-120 44.50 - 78.01 81-89 78 - 95 74-150 80-90
System Analysts 50 - 80 37.14 - 62.29 63 - 68 58 - 78 55-75 80-90
Senior System Analysts 55 - 85 46.23 - 77.05 76 - 83 66 - 90 69-110 85-92
Project Leaders 70 - 105 52.57 - 81.40 80 - 88 75-95 70-90 95-110
Project Facilitators 85-120 39.49- 71.18 72-79 70-90 50-75 90 - 95
IT Project Managers 80 -120 64.50 - 87 88 - 96 77 -110 75-100 100 - 115
Data Specialist 75 - 100 48.07 - 66.48 72-79 68 - 87 66-120 85-92
Software Specialist 75-100 40.34 - 65.20 66 -72 60 - 165 50-70 78 - 82
Sr. Software Specialist 85-110 49.64 - 81.94 88 - 96 80 - 190 70-85 85-95
Database Specialists 75-110 48.10 - 68.57 80 - 88 73-95 65-85 90 - 97
Business Recovery Analysts 80-110 39.40- 70.74 81-89 70 -90 74-120
Capacity Mgmt. Specialist 45-70 78.44 - 112.37 No bid 70 -90 74-120
Service Support Specialist 40 - 80 24.38 - 43.33 38-42 40 - 55 35-45 70 -80
Service Support Administrator 50 - 90 31.80 - 46.80 47 - 51 50 - 65 40-55 75-85
System Control Specialist 50 - 80 36.11 - 56.54 No bid 70-92 45-55
Computer Operator 20-30 32.47 - 54.01 No bid 35-48 25-35 55 - 65
Sr. Computer Operator 25-35 36.11 - 56.54 No bid 43 - 60 35-45 60 - 68
Lead Computer Operator 30-45 36.11 - 56.54 No bid 48 - 70 45-55
Output Mgmt. Specialist 25-35 29.70 - 48.40 No bid 45-75 35-45 55 -65
Lead Output Mgmt. Specialist 30-45 32.21- 51.88 No bid 60 - 85 45-55 60 - 68
Production Scheduler 45-70 46.65 - 63.03 No bid 55-80 35-45
Storage Mgmt. Specialist 35-60 45.05 - 64.16 No bid 70-95 74-120
System Administrator 55-75 39 - 55.81 No bid 60 - 85 45-55 85-95
Technical Writer 25-55 37.15- 62.21 No bid 39-55 45-80 60 -70
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DTI-04-0087, Technical Staffing and Services

New Contract Vendors
PRICING MATRIX
[Effective July 1, 2004]
(14 pages total)

Applied Brandywine

Technologies, Technology Cannon Technology Computer Aid, Covansys

Inc. Partners Solutions, Inc. CIBER, Inc. Inc. Corporation
Client Server
Programmer/Analysts 40-80 41.48 - 68.76 66 -72 65 - 85 60-110 70-80
Senior Programmer/Analysts 45 -85 47.19 - 73.61 72-79 71-95 65-140 75-85
E-commerce Programmer 75-110 42.07 - 69.84 66 -72 70-95 50-125 75-85
Senior E-commerce Programmer 85-120 44.50 - 78.01 81-89 80 -98 74-125 85-92
System Analysts 50 - 80 37.14 - 62.29 63 - 68 68 - 87 60-120 82-95
Senior System Analysts 55-85 46.23 - 77.05 76 - 83 80 -98 69-150 90 - 95
Project Leaders 70 - 105 52.57 - 81.40 80 - 88 75-95 80-105 95-110
Project Facilitators 85-120 39.49- 71.18 72-79 70-90 50-75 95 - 105
IT Project Managers 80 -120 64.50 - 87 88 - 96 85-120 80-120 110 - 120
Data Specialist 75-100 48.07 - 66.48 72-79 68 - 87 50-120 85 —-92
Software Specialist 75-100 40.34 - 65.20 66 - 72 75-175 50-75 85-92
Sr. Software Specialist 85-110 49.64 - 81.94 88 - 96 95 -190 80-140 88 - 97
Database Specialists 75-110 48.10 - 68.57 80 - 88 78 - 98 70-100 90 - 100
Business Recovery Analysts 80-110 39.40- 70.74 81-89 70-90 75-120
Capacity Mgmt. Specialist 45-70 78.44 - 112.37 No bid 70-90 75-120
Service Support Specialist 40 - 80 24.38 - 43.33 38-42 40 - 55 35-45 70-80
Service Support Administrator 50 - 90 31.80 - 46.80 47 - 51 50 - 65 40-55 75 -85
System Control Specialist 50 - 80 36.11 - 56.54 No bid 70 -92 45-55
Computer Operator 20 - 30 32.47 - 54.01 No bid 35-48 25-35 55 -65
Sr. Computer Operator 25-35 36.11 - 56.54 No bid 43 - 60 35-45 60 - 68
Lead Computer Operator 30 -45 36.11 - 56.54 No bid 48 - 70 45-55
Output Mgmt. Specialist 25-35 29.70 - 48.40 No bid 45-75 35-45 55 - 65
Lead Output Mgmt. Specialist 30 -45 32.21- 51.88 No bid 60 - 85 45-55 60 - 68
Production Scheduler 45-70 46.65 - 63.03 No bid 55-80 35-45
Storage Mgmt. Specialist 35-60 45.05 - 64.16 No bid 70-95 75-120
System Administrator 55-75 39 - 55.81 No bid 60 - 85 45-55 88 - 97
Technical Writer 25-55 37.15- 62.21 No bid 39-55 45-80 60-70
Platform Independent Services
Business Analysts 75-110 42.72 - 64.91 76 - 83 75.00 69-120 85-95
E-commerce Analysts 75-110 43.03 - 73.70 69 - 89 83.00 75-125 90 - 100
E-commerce Software Specialist 85-120 4510 - 76.06 87 - 95 92.00 79-125 88 -95
Disaster Recovery Coordinator 64.50 - 87
IT Architects 95-130 78.44 - 112.37 99 - 108 105.00 90-175 90 - 110

Page 4 of 14




DTI-04-0087, Technical Staffing and Services
New Contract Vendors
PRICING MATRIX
[Effective July 1, 2004]
(14 pages total)

Global
CSS Technical Diamond Drexel EDS Information FuturTech Computer
Services Technologies Inc. Technical Services, LLC | Consulting LLC Associates-NY

Mainframe
Programmer/Analysts 38-56 60-65 81.68 — 98.31 45-75 45- 60
Senior Programmer/Analysts 55-72 65-70 81.73- 112.02 | 60-85 55- 70
E-commerce Programmer 46-65 60-65 81.73 45-85 55- 65
Senior E-commerce Programmer 62-80 74-79 95.03 - 120.92 | 60-90 65- 90
System Analysts 38-56 57-62 59.96 50-65 50- 70
Senior System Analysts 55-72 69-74 68.86 - 95.03 60-75 55- 85
Project Leaders 69-88 73-78 102.19 65-85 65- 80
Project Facilitators 55-72 66-71 81.73- 112.02 | 55-75 No Bid
IT Project Managers 69-88 80-85 95.03 70-110 65- 95
Data Specialist 55-72 66-71 59.96 60-75 60- 95
Software Specialist 55-72 60-65 68.86 60-75 65- 85
Sr. Software Specialist 62-80 80-85 81.73 - 95.03 70-95 70- 95
Database Specialists 55-72 72-77 81.73 - 95.03 60-85 70 - 110
Business Recovery Analysts 46-65 74-79 81.73 55-85 No Bid
Capacity Mgmt. Specialist 55-72 74-79 81.73 50-75
Service Support Specialist 31-49 35-40 51.85 34-40 30- 40
Service Support Administrator 38-56 43-48 59.96 35-45 45- 58
System Control Specialist 38-56 69-74 68.86 50-65
Computer Operator 23-40 32-37 48.63 45-65
Sr. Computer Operator 38-56 37-42 59.96 48-65 35- 50
Lead Computer Operator 55-72 42-47 59.96 60-75 40- 55
Output Mgmt. Specialist 31-49 37-42 39.92 34-45
Lead Output Mgmt. Specialist 46-65 42-47 51.85 38-50
Production Scheduler 38-56 55-60 39.92 50-65
Storage Mgmt. Specialist 31-49 55-60 48.63 55-75
System Administrator 46-65 65-75 68.86 45-65 40 - 65
Technical Writer 31-49 60-70 59.96 38-75 40 - 65
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DTI-04-0087, Technical Staffing and Services
New Contract Vendors
PRICING MATRIX

[Effective July 1,

2004]

(14 pages total)

Global
CSS Technical Diamond Drexel EDS Information FuturTech Computer
Services Technologies Inc. Technical Services, LLC | Consulting LLC Associates-NY
Client Server
Programmer/Analysts 38-56 70- 80 65-70 81.68 — 98.31 45-75 50- 60
Senior Programmer/Analysts 55-72 80- 90 70-75 81.73- 112.02 | 60-85 60- 85
E-commerce Programmer 46-65 75- 85 50-55 81.73 45-85 55- 70
Senior E-commerce Programmer 62-80 85- 95 80-85 95.03 - 120.92 | 60-90 65- 90
System Analysts 38-56 70- 80 60-65 59.96 50-65 55- 75
Senior System Analysts 55-72 75- 85 66-71 68.86 - 95.03 60-80 70- 90
Project Leaders 69-88 90 - 100 80-85 102.19 70-95 70- 95
Project Facilitators 55-72 75- 85 68-73 81.73- 112.02 | 55-75
IT Project Managers 69-88 95- 105 80-85 95.03 70-110 70- 95
Data Specialist 55-72 70 - 80 50-55 59.96 50-75 70- 95
Software Specialist 55-72 75- 85 75-80 68.86 60-75 65- 85
Sr. Software Specialist 62-80 80 - 90 80-85 81.73 - 95.03 70-95 70- 95
Database Specialists 55-72 85- 95 70-75 81.73 - 95.03 60-85 70 - 110
Business Recovery Analysts 46-65 75- 85 75-80 81.73 55-70
Capacity Mgmt. Specialist 55-72 90 - 100 75-85 81.73 50-75
Service Support Specialist 31-49 45 - 55 35-40 51.85 34-40 30- 40
Service Support Administrator 38-56 50 - 60 43-48 59.96 34-45 45- 58
System Control Specialist 38-56 50 - 60 69-74 68.86 50-65
Computer Operator 23-40 32-37 48.63 45-65
Sr. Computer Operator 38-56 37-42 59.96 48-65 35- 50
Lead Computer Operator 55-72 42-47 59.96 60-75 40- 55
Output Mgmt. Specialist 31-49 37-42 39.92 34-45
Lead Output Mgmt. Specialist 46-65 42-47 51.85 38-50
Production Scheduler 38-56 55-60 39.92 50-65
Storage Mgmt. Specialist 31-49 55-60 48.63 55-75
System Administrator 46-65 80- 90 65-75 68.86 45-65 40 - 65
Technical Writer 31-49 60-70 59.96 38-55 40 - 65
Platform Independent Services
Business Analysts 55-72 75-85 65-74 59.96 63-67 60 - 85
E-commerce Analysts 55-72 80-90 69-79 81.73 68-75 70-100
E-commerce Software Specialist 55-72 85-95 73-84 76.84 71-75
Disaster Recovery Coordinator 80-85 81.73
IT Architects 85-105 110 - 120 90-95 142.03 85-92 80 -125
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DTI-04-0087, Technical Staffing and Services

New Contract Vendors
PRICING MATRIX
[Effective July 1, 2004]
(14 pages total)

Global Information Integrated
Computer Higland Technical HTC Global IBM Consulting Business
Associates-NJ Services, Inc. Services Coprporation Info Systems Services, Inc. Solutions
Mainframe
Programmer/Analysts 42 - 54 55.59 82.51 35-45 95- 150 33 -46 55-75 40 - 67
Senior Programmer/Analysts 50 - 68 68 - 83.15 38-48 100 - 175 46 — 62 65— 85 45-75
E-commerce Programmer 45 - 68 68 - 83.15 95- 150 44 — 51 65— 85 45-75
Senior E-commerce Programmer 60 - 84 73.23 99.78 100 - 175 52 — 58 75-95 60 - 85
System Analysts 52 - 62 55.59 82.51 42-52 120 - 175 41-50 70-90 50-70
Senior System Analysts 56- 72 68 - 83.15 45-55 130 - 255 51-60 75-95 60-75
Project Leaders 58- 76 72.48 86.15 50-60 250 - 435 58 — 66 75-95 65-120
Project Facilitators 48 - 63 55.59 72.48 50-62 92- 175 33 - 41 80 —100 60 - 75
IT Project Managers 62- 78 72.48 86.15 55-65 150 - 255 41 -66 100 — 120 90- 165
Data Specialist 50 - 68 53.99 71.71 50-60 125 - 255 37-62 95 -115
Software Specialist 50 - 68 53.99 71.71 45-58 140 - 225 38 — 54 95 -115 45-70
Sr. Software Specialist 60 - 82 68 - 99.78 45-60 150 - 255 55 - 66 100 — 120 55 -85
Database Specialists 58 - 82 68 - 99.78 55-65 150 - 255 46 -70 95-115
Business Recovery Analysts 56 - 74 53.99 71.71 175 - 255 46 — 58 85—-105 55 -85
Capacity Mgmt. Specialist 68 - 99.78 175 - 255 58 - 75 100 — 120
Service Support Specialist 38- 54 53.99 68 175 - 255 29 - 37 65 -85
Service Support Administrator 52- 75 55.59 71.71 50-65 145 - 175 34 - 46 65 -85
System Control Specialist 55.59 71.71 175 - 255 50 — 58 65— 85
Computer Operator 53.99 68 22-29 45 - 65
Sr. Computer Operator 55.59 71.71 30-37 50-70
Lead Computer Operator 55.59 68 38 -55 50-70
Output Mgmt. Specialist 55.59 68 22 -25 65 -85
Lead Output Mgmt. Specialist 53.99 68 145- 175 33-41 70-90
Production Scheduler 53.99 68 145- 175 30-37 65 -85
Storage Mgmt. Specialist 83.15 99.78 55-70 145 - 205 40 -55 65 -85
System Administrator 48 - 70 55.59 68 55-70 145- 205 43 - 56 70-90
Technical Writer 36 - 52 38.11 45.73 25-45 90 - 205 31-40 40 - 60 40-70

Page 7 of 14




DTI-04-0087, Technical Staffing and Services
New Contract Vendors
PRICING MATRIX
[Effective July 1, 2004]
(14 pages total)

Global Information Integrated
Computer Higland Technical HTC Global IBM Consulting Business
Associates-NJ Services, Inc. Services Coprporation Info Systems Services, Inc. Solutions
Client Server
Programmer/Analysts 44 - 58 55.59 82.51 40-50 95- 150 37— 48 60 - 80 40 - 67
Senior Programmer/Analysts 52- 74 68 - 83.15 43-53 100 - 175 41-62 70-90 55-110
E-commerce Programmer 45 - 68 68 - 83.15 45-55 95- 150 44 — 51 65 -85 50 - 80
Senior E-commerce Programmer 60 - 84 73.23 99.78 48-58 100 - 175 52 — 58 75-95 60 - 85
System Analysts 55- 74 55.59 82.51 45-55 120 - 175 41-50 75-95 55-110
Senior System Analysts 58- 78 68 - 83.15 48-58 130 - 255 51-60 75-95 65 - 150
Project Leaders 58 - 80 72.48 86.15 50-65 250 - 435 58 — 66 85-105 65- 165
Project Facilitators 48 - 63 55.59 72.48 50-65 92 - 175 33-41 90 - 110 60 - 85
IT Project Managers 62 - 84 72.48 86.15 55-68 150 - 255 41 -66 100 - 120 90 - 165
Data Specialist 50- 74 53.99 71.71 50-60 125 - 255 37 -62 95-115
Software Specialist 54 - 76 53.99 71.71 48-60 140 - 225 38 - 54 95-115 55-110
Sr. Software Specialist 60 - 88 68 - 99.78 50-65 150 - 255 55 - 66 100 - 120 65 - 150
Database Specialists 58 - 88 68 - 99.78 48-60 150 - 255 46 -70 95-115
Business Recovery Analysts 56 - 74 53.99 71.71 175 - 255 46 — 58 85-105 55 -85
Capacity Mgmt. Specialist 68 - 99.78 175 - 255 58 - 75 100 - 120
Service Support Specialist 38- 54 53.99 68 175 - 255 29 - 37 65— 85
Service Support Administrator 52- 78 55.59 71.71 50-65 145 - 175 34 - 46 65— 85
System Control Specialist 55.59 71.71 175 - 255 50 — 58 65 -85
Computer Operator 53.99 68 22-29 45 - 65
Sr. Computer Operator 55.59 71.71 30-37 50-70
Lead Computer Operator 55.59 68 38 -55 50-70
Output Mgmt. Specialist 55.59 68 22-25 65— 85
Lead Output Mgmt. Specialist 53.99 68 145- 175 33-41 70 -90
Production Scheduler 53.99 68 145- 175 30-37 65 -85
Storage Mgmt. Specialist 83.15 99.78 55-70 145 - 205 40-55 65 -85
System Administrator 46 - 70 55.59 68 45-60 145- 205 43 - 56 70-90
Technical Writer 36 - 52 38.11 45.73 25-45 90 - 205 31-40 40 - 60 40-70
Platform Independent Services
Business Analysts 62- 78 55.59 83.15-125 |50-65 125 - 255 33-50 75-95 45-90
E-commerce Analysts 56- 70 71.7183.15-125 |55-65 125 - 255 44 — 51 80 -100 55-90
E-commerce Software Specialist 60 - 88 83.15 125 55-70 125 - 255 54 — 62 85-105 60 - 100
Disaster Recovery Coordinator 145 - 205 66 — 83 70 - 160
IT Architects 76 - 98 83.15 125 60-80 145 - 255 66 — 83 100 - 120
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DTI-04-0087, Technical Staffing and Services
New Contract Vendors
PRICING MATRIX
[Effective July 1, 2004]
(14 pages total)

Leading Edge Niagra

IntePros Judge Technical Systems Consulting Persona

Consulting Services, Inc. Richmond, Inc. Micro Tek Modis Inc. |Group, Inc. Computing
Mainframe
Programmer/Analysts 50 - 60 45-50 35-55 55-80 45-75 39-52 39.68-49.92
Senior Programmer/Analysts 55-65 50-60 45-75 65 -95 61-90 45-62 42.24-55.04
E-commerce Programmer 50 - 60 60-65 40 - 55 65 -95 45-75 39-53 55.04-62.72
Senior E-commerce Programmer 64 -74 65-70 50 - 85 80-120 65-95 45-62 60.16-75.52
System Analysts 50 - 57 58-62 42 - 65 65—-95 45-75 39-52 37.12-44.80
Senior System Analysts 60 - 69 60-65 55-90 75-105 |60-85 46-62 44.80-55.04
Project Leaders 65-73 60-70 50 - 80 85-110 65-85 49-59 29.44-38.40
Project Facilitators 58 - 66 55-60 50 - 89 65 - 95 35-65 48-58 35.84-44.80
IT Project Managers 70 - 80 70-75 50 - 95 90-125 | 55-105 55-72 48.64-57.60
Data Specialist 58 - 66 65-70 60 - 105 85-150 35-75 42-54 48.64-56.32
Software Specialist 50 - 60 55-60 50 - 85 75-105 35-64 42-51 19.20-32
Sr. Software Specialist 70 - 80 60-75 60 - 90 90-125 40-70 47-56 23.04-38.40
Database Specialists 65-72 80-90 60 - 110 90-150 50-80 45-62 38.40-51.20
Business Recovery Analysts 65-74 60-70 60 - 124 85-150 40-75 45-52 39.68-49.92
Capacity Mgmt. Specialist 40 - 65 50-60 50 - 98 95 - 150 30-65 49-56 35.84-48.64
Service Support Specialist 28 - 35 50-60 25-40 40 - 65 20-27 21-30 16.64-24.32
Service Support Administrator 35-43 55-65 35-50 45-70 25-35 27-39 23.04-33.28
System Control Specialist 45-75 40-50 50 - 80 30-50 49-59 46.08-57.60
Computer Operator 20 - 40 35-40 25-35 25-30 17-22 20.48-30.72
Sr. Computer Operator 25 -45 40-50 35 -47 27-35 19-28 25.60-37.12
Lead Computer Operator 35-50 50-55 40 - 55 30-45 28-38 23.04-32
Output Mgmt. Specialist 25-42 80-90 30 -45 20-35 35-40 15.36-23.04
Lead Output Mgmt. Specialist 25 - 47 70-80 40 - 50 35-60 37-46 37.12-48.64
Production Scheduler 38 -50 55-65 35-55 40-65 33-42 28.16-44.80
Storage Mgmt. Specialist 32-48 50-60 40-75 60-85 35-48 32-43.52
System Administrator 50-75 50-60 55-90 40-60 45-62 44.80-61.44
Technical Writer 30-50 40-50 35-60 45 -80 40-70 35-46 35.84-48.64
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DTI-04-0087, Technical Staffing and Services

New Contract Vendors
PRICING MATRIX
[Effective July 1, 2004]
(14 pages total)

Leading Edge Niagra

IntePros Judge Technical Systems Consulting Persona

Consulting Services, Inc. Richmond, Inc. Micro Tek Modis Inc. |Group, Inc. Computing
Client Server I
Programmer/Analysts 50 - 60 46-50 35-55 70-105 |45-75 39-52 40.96-53.76
Senior Programmer/Analysts 50 - 65 60-65 45-75 75-140 61-90 45-62 46.08-61.44
E-commerce Programmer 60-70 60-65 40 - 55 75-145 |45-75 39-53 55.04-62.72
Senior E-commerce Programmer 70 - 80 65-70 50 - 85 90-155 65-95 45-62 60.16-75.52
System Analysts 50 - 60 60-65 42 - 65 75-135 |45-75 39-52 39.68-46.08
Senior System Analysts 58 - 66 63-68 55-90 85-145 60-85 46-62 48.64-56.32
Project Leaders 70 - 80 60-80 50 - 80 90-150 65-85 49-59 29.44-38.40
Project Facilitators 60 - 66 60-70 50 - 89 75-135 |35-65 48-58 35.84-44.80
IT Project Managers 70 - 80 75-85 50 - 95 115-185 |55-105 55-72 48.64-48.64
Data Specialist 45 - 50 70-75 60 - 105 95-175 35-75 42-54 49.92-60.16
Software Specialist 65-75 55-60 50 - 85 95-160 35-64 42-51 19.20-33.28
Sr. Software Specialist 70-80 60-80 60 - 90 115-185 40-70 47-56 23.04-38.40
Database Specialists 45-70 80-90 60 - 110 105-175 |50-80 45-62 40.96-52.48
Business Recovery Analysts 65-75 60-70 60 - 124 85-150 40-75 45-52 42.24-55.04
Capacity Mgmt. Specialist 40 - 65 55-65 50 - 98 105-180 30-65 49-56 37.12-49.92
Service Support Specialist 28 - 35 55-65 25-40 40 - 65 20-27 21-30 19.20-25.60
Service Support Administrator 35-45 60-70 35-50 45-70 25-35 27-39 23.04-37.12
System Control Specialist 45-75 55-65 50 - 80 30-50 49-59 48.64-57.60
Computer Operator 20 - 40 40-45 25-35 25-30 17-22 20.48-30.72
Sr. Computer Operator 25 -45 45-55 35 -47 27-35 19-28 25.60-37.12
Lead Computer Operator 35-50 50-60 40 - 55 30-45 28-38 23.04-32
Output Mgmt. Specialist 25-42 85-90 30 - 45 20-35 35-40 15.36-23.04
Lead Output Mgmt. Specialist 25 - 47 55-65 40 - 50 35-60 37-46 37.12-48.64
Production Scheduler 38 - 50 60-70 35-55 40-65 33-42 28.16-44.80
Storage Mgmt. Specialist 32-48 70-75 40-75 60-85 35-48 32-43.52
System Administrator 50-75 65-75 55-90 40-60 45-62 44.80-61.44
Technical Writer 32-51 50-60 35-60 45 - 80 40-70 35-46 35.84-48.64
Platform Independent Services
Business Analysts 58 - 65 55-65 55-90 95-150 40-65 52-65 38.40-48.64
E-commerce Analysts 60 - 69 60-70 60 - 123 80 - 130 55-85 52-62 40.96-51.20
E-commerce Software Specialist 65-73 70-85 65-123 85 - 140 55-85 54-65 44.80-62.72
Disaster Recovery Coordinator 65-129 100 - 175
IT Architects 75-90 80-100 70-125 105-225 70-110 62-80 83.20-101.12
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DTI-04-0087, Technical Staffing and Services
New Contract Vendors
PRICING MATRIX
[Effective July 1, 2004]
(14 pages total)

Smart

Progressive Software Prosift Robert Half Sabre Systems, Source Secure Software Sogeti

Computing, Inc. LLC Technology Inc. Tech Data. Inc. Galeria, Inc. |[USA
Mainframe
Programmer/Analysts 60-65 40-50 50 - 58 35-41 38-58 33-48 52 - 66
Senior Programmer/Analysts 65-70 50-60 60 - 71 60-72 62-75 38-53 59-72
E-commerce Programmer 60-65 55-65 55 -60 66-78 45-60 28-48 52 - 66
Senior E-commerce Programmer 75-80 65-80 68 - 75 82-96 62-75 35-53 66 - 78
System Analysts 58-63 45-55 45 - 55 45-54 60-72 38-55 59-72
Senior System Analysts 70-75 55-65 58 -78 70-85 40-58 66 - 78
Project Leaders 75-79 65-75 65-75 80-105 52-64 78 - 98
Project Facilitators 67-72 60-70 60 — 65 54-66 48-63 59-72
IT Project Managers 79-84 75-85 70-80 95-120 52-64 98 - 114
Data Specialist 68-73 65-80 55 -65 65-80 48-59 66 - 78
Software Specialist 65-70 55-70 55 -60 37-48 42-55 66 -78
Sr. Software Specialist 78-83 65-75 68 —78 60-75 48-57 72-78
Database Specialists 75-80 60-70 49-70 96-120 42-80 47-63 69 - 81
Business Recovery Analysts 75-80 55-75 65-75 94-115 52-67 72-78
Capacity Mgmt. Specialist 70-75 35-45 60 -72 75-88 55-70 72-78
Service Support Specialist 45-50 25-35 27 — 34 40-52 52-65 25-46
Service Support Administrator 52-57 35-40 35-43 65-75 52-65 41 -52
System Control Specialist 25-35 42 -50 40-52 52-65 52 — 66
Computer Operator 15-20 23 -30 32-44 55-75 35-50
Sr. Computer Operator 18-23 31-38 54-68 38-55
Lead Computer Operator 20-25 39-43 66-76 40-58
Output Mgmt. Specialist 18-23 23-30 35-44 40-58
Lead Output Mgmt. Specialist 20-25 31-38 36-46 52-65
Production Scheduler 18-23 31-38 57-68 52-65
Storage Mgmt. Specialist 25-30 31-38 52-65 55-70
System Administrator 70-73 30-35 45 - 62 60-72 38-72 38-55 52 — 66
Technical Writer 53-58 25-30 44 — 55 48-60 32-48 41 -52
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DTI-04-0087, Technical Staffing and Services

New Contract Vendors
PRICING MATRIX
[Effective July 1, 2004]

(14 pages total)

Smart

Progressive Software Prosift Robert Half Sabre Systems, Source Secure Software Sogeti

Computing, Inc. LLC Technology Inc. Tech Data. Inc. Galeria, Inc. |[USA
Client Server
Programmer/Analysts 62-67 45-60 53 - 60 32-38 55-75 33-48 59-72
Senior Programmer/Analysts 70-75 65-75 60 - 71 54-64 65-85 38-53 72-78
E-commerce Programmer 55-65 68-78 45 - 55 60-72 55-75 30-50 52 - 66
Senior E-commerce Programmer 77-83 75-85 70-78 75-90 70-90 35-53 66 - 78
System Analysts 60-65 50-60 45 - 55 40-48 65-85 36-54 66 - 78
Senior System Analysts 68-73 60-70 58 -78 62-75 70-90 40-58 78-78
Project Leaders 80-85 75-85 73-80 70-90 65-75 52-64 78-98
Project Facilitators 68-73 65-75 62 — 67 47-58 70-90 48-62 66 - 78
IT Project Managers 80-85 80-90 70 - 80 85-100 75-55 52-65 98 -114
Data Specialist 53-58 65-80 48 — 53 55-70 55-75 48-60 66 - 78
Software Specialist 73-78 55-72 62-72 32-38 55-75 42-55 66 -78
Sr. Software Specialist 79-84 75-90 68 - 78 54-64 65-85 48-57 78-78
Database Specialists 70-80 65-85 49-70 88-105 60-80 47-62 72-78
Business Recovery Analysts 75-80 65-90 65-75 85-105 65-85 52-67 72-78
Capacity Mgmt. Specialist 70-75 40-50 60-72 60-68 65-85 55-67 72-78
Service Support Specialist 48-52 25-35 27 - 34 33-40 55-75 52-65 25-46
Service Support Administrator 55-62 35-40 35-43 57-68 60-80 52-65 41 -52
System Control Specialist 25-35 42 - 50 34-42 60-80 52-65 52 — 66
Computer Operator 15-20 23 -30 25-33 55-75 33-48
Sr. Computer Operator 18-23 31-38 44-54 60-80 36-52
Lead Computer Operator 20-25 39-43 59-67 65-85 38-55
Output Mgmt. Specialist 18-23 23 -30 29-36 55-75 38-55
Lead Output Mgmt. Specialist 20-25 31-38 31-38 60-70 52-65
Production Scheduler 18-23 31-38 50-62 55-75 52-65
Storage Mgmt. Specialist 25-30 31-38 44-55 60-80 55-67
System Administrator 70-73 30-35 45 - 62 55-68 60-80 36-52 52 — 66
Technical Writer 53-58 25-30 44 — 55 48-60 55-75 32-48 41 -52
Platform Independent Services
Business Analysts 70-73 45-65 60 -70 75-95 60-80 55-68 59 -72
E-commerce Analysts 73-80 50-70 62-75 65-85 60-80 40-58 59-72
E-commerce Software Specialist 75-82 55-80 65-77 60-80 65-85 42-60 59 -72
Disaster Recovery Coordinator 62-72 85-98 70-90 97 — 111
IT Architects 85-90 80-110 80 -90 95-110 80-100 60-80 116 - 128
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DTI-04-0087, Technical Staffing and Services
New Contract Vendors
PRICING MATRIX
[Effective July 1, 2004]
(14 pages total)

Tech

International of |Vel Micro Versalign,

Delaware, Inc. |Works, Inc. Inc.
Mainframe
Programmer/Analysts 38 -50 53 - 60
Senior Programmer/Analysts 45 - 57 60 - 67
E-commerce Programmer 45 - 54 59 - 65
Senior E-commerce Programmer 50 - 65 67- 75
System Analysts 44 — 52 52 - 59
Senior System Analysts 53 - 65 64 - 72
Project Leaders 54 -70 68 - 76
Project Facilitators 50 - 60 60 - 67
IT Project Managers 60—-78 73- 82
Data Specialist 50 - 63 65- 72
Software Specialist 45 -55 57 - 64
Sr. Software Specialist 55 -65 72 - 80
Database Specialists 52-70 67 - 75
Business Recovery Analysts 66 - 74
Capacity Mgmt. Specialist 67 - 75
Service Support Specialist 34 - 38
Service Support Administrator 44 - 50
System Control Specialist 40 - 45
Computer Operator 31- 35
Sr. Computer Operator 34 - 38
Lead Computer Operator 38- 43
Output Mgmt. Specialist 28 - 32
Lead Output Mgmt. Specialist 31- 35
Production Scheduler 36 - 40
Storage Mgmt. Specialist 53 - 60
System Administrator 57 - 64
Technical Writer 54 - 59
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DTI-04-0087, Technical Staffing and Services
New Contract Vendors
PRICING MATRIX
[Effective July 1, 2004]
(14 pages total)

Tech

International of |Vel Micro Versalign,

Delaware, Inc. |Works, Inc. Inc.
Client Server
Programmer/Analysts 56 - 64 42 — 52 59 - 67
Senior Programmer/Analysts 63 - 69 48 — 62 65- 73
E-commerce Programmer 47 - 54 45 - 54 50 - 56
Senior E-commerce Programmer 65-75 50 — 65 71- 80
System Analysts 53 - 62 45 - 58 57 - 64
Senior System Analysts 63-70 55 -65 64 - 72
Project Leaders 72 - 80 55-75 75- 83
Project Facilitators 60 - 68 50 - 60 60 - 67
IT Project Managers 72 -80 60—78 73- 82
Data Specialist 56 - 64 50 - 63 49 - 55
Software Specialist 70-75 45 -55 66 - 75
Sr. Software Specialist 74 - 80 55 -68 72 - 80
Database Specialists 47 - 55 50 -70 67 - 75
Business Recovery Analysts 70-75 66 - 74
Capacity Mgmt. Specialist 60 - 68 67 - 75
Service Support Specialist 40-50 34 - 38
Service Support Administrator 42 - 50 44 - 50
System Control Specialist 48 - 56 40 - 45
Computer Operator 52 - 60 31- 35
Sr. Computer Operator 55- 63 34 - 38
Lead Computer Operator 58 - 66 38 - 43
Output Mgmt. Specialist 50 - 58 28 - 32
Lead Output Mgmt. Specialist 54 - 62 31- 35
Production Scheduler 50 - 55 36 - 40
Storage Mgmt. Specialist 52 - 60 53 - 60
System Administrator 54 - 62 57 - 64
Technical Writer 45 -60 54 - 59
Platform Independent Services
Business Analysts 55 -65 67- 75
E-commerce Analysts 60-70 71- 80
E-commerce Software Specialist 55-75 71- 80
Disaster Recovery Coordinator 75- 85
IT Architects 80 — 90 80- 90
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